GOVERNMENT OF THE PUNJAB
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Dated Lahore the 9" September, 2013

NOTIFICATIO

No.FD-SR-11/2-141/2012. In exercise of the powers conferred under Section 23 of the
Punjab Civil Servants Act, 1974 (Punjab Act No.VIll of 1974), the Governor of the
Punjab is pleased to adopt Notification No.S.R.0.70(KE)/2012 dated 29" August,
2012 of Government of Pakistan, Ministry of Finance and Revenue {Finance Division)
(Regulations Wing} Islamabad, with the following amendments in Rule 17 of the
Revised Leave Rules, 1881:-

A

NDMENTS

@

(it)

(i)

In Rule 17, for the words "One hundred and eighty’ wherever
occurring, the words “three hundred and sixty five' shall he
substituted; and

In sub-rules (2) & (5) for the words "One hundred and eighty”
the words "three hundred and sixty five" shall be substituted,

After sub-rule (5), amended as aforesaid, the following new sub-
rules shall be inserted, namely:-

(6)

(6-A)

Encashment of leave preparatory to retirement (LPR) not
exceeding three hundred and sixty five days shall be
effective from the first day of September, 2013 and shall,
for the entire period of leave refused or opted for
encashment, be applicable to a civil servant retired or, as
the cases may be, retiring on or after the first day of
September, 2013, provided such leave is available at his
credit subject to a maximum of three hundred and sixty five
days.

The encashment of LPR shall also be applicable to
employees of the autonomous and semi-autonomous
bodies under Administrative control of the Punjab
Government which have adopted basic pay scales
schemes and these rules in toto.



(B-B) If at any time during such period, leave is granted on
account of ill health supported by Medical Certificate or for
performance of Hajj, the amount of cash compensation on
account of leave pay shall be reduced by an amount equal
to the leave pay for the period of leave so granted.

{6-C) Leave pay for the purpose of encashment of LPR shall be
computed on the basis of pay and allowances reckonable

towards pension as shown in the last pay certificate of a
civil servant.

MOHAMMAD JEHANZEB KHAN

FINANCE SECRETARY
NO, & DATE EVEN

A copy is forwarded for information and necessary action to:-
1. All Administrative Secretaries to Government of the Punjab.
2 The Principal Secretary to Governor, Punjab, Lahore.

3 The Principal Secretery to Chief Minister, Punjab, Lahore.
4, The Military Secretary to Governor, Punjab, Lahore.

5. The Secretary, Punjab Provincial Assembly, Lahore.

6. The Secretary, Punjab Public Service Commission, Lahore.
7 All Heads of Attached Departments in the Punjab.

8 All Commissioners in the Punjab.

8. All District Coardination Officers in the Punjab.

10. Al District & Sessions Judges in the Punjab.

11.  The Chief Pilot, VIP Flight, Lahore,

12.  The Registrar, Lahere High Court, Lahore.

13.  The Director General, Audit (Works) Lzahore.,

14.  The Director General, Accounts (Works) Lahore.

15.  The Director General, (Districts Audit) Punjab Lahore.

16.  The Director General, Audit, Punjab Lahore

7. The Provincial Director, Local Fund Audit, Punjab, Lahore.

(SHAFAATAL)  ~04. 0G. 2013
DEPUTY SECRETARY (S.R.)
NO. & DATE EVEN

A copy is forwarded for information and necessary action to the:-

1. Accountant General, Punjab, Lahore.
2. All District Accounts Officers in Punjab/Treasury Officer, Lahore.

(ABDUL AZIZ BHUTTI)
SECTION OFFICER (SR-lI)



GOVERNMENT OF THE PUNJAB
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Dated Lahore the 11™ April, 2014
NOTIFICATION

No.FD SR-1/12-141/2012, In exercise of the powers conferred under Section 23 of the
Punjab Civil Servants Act, 1974 (Punjab Act NoVIll of 1974) and in continuation of
Finance Department’s Notification No.FD.SR-IV2-141/2012 dated 08" September, 2013,
read with Notification No.S.R.0.70(KE)/2012 dated 28™ August, 2012 of Government of
Pakistan, Ministry of Finance and Revenue (Finance Division) Regulations Wing,
Islamabad, the Governer of the Punjab Is pleased to insert following amendment in
Rule 19 of the Revised Leave Rules, 1881 w.e.f. 01.09.2013

“In rule 18, for the words “one hundred and eighty” wherever occurring,
the words "three hundred and sixty five" shall be substituted.”

MOHAMMAD JEHANZEB KHAN
FINANCE SECRETARY
NO. & DATE EVEN

A copy is forwarded for information and necessary action to:-

1. All Administrative Secretaries to Government of the Punjab.
2 The Princlpal Secretary to Govemor, Punjab, Lahore.
% The Principal Secretary to Chief Minister, Punjab, Lahore.
4. The Milltary Secretary to Govemor, Punjab, Lahore.
5. The Secretary, Punjab Provincial Assembly, Lahore.
6. The Secratary, Punjab Public Service Commisslon, Lahore,
F All Heads of Attached Depariments in the Punjab.-
8. All Commissioners in the Punjab.
9, All District Coordination Officers in the Punjab.
10. All District & Sessions Judges in the Punjab.
11. The Chief Pilot, CIP Flight, Lahore,
12. The Registrar, Lahore High Court, Lahore.
13. The Director General, Audit (Works) Lahore.
14, The Direclor General, Accounts (Works) Lahore.
15. The Director General, (Districts Audit) Punjab Lahore.
16. The Diraclor General, Audit, Punjab Lahore
i7. The Provincial Director, Local Fund Audit, Punjab, Lahorg,
f
@HAFAATALY ¢ (
DEPUTY SECRETARY (SR)
NO. & DATE EVEN

A copy is forwarded or information and necessary action to:-

1. The Accountant General, Punjab, Lahore.
2, All the District Accounts Officers in the Punjab/Tre fficer, Lahore

(SHAFAAT ALI) et
DEPUTY SECRETARY (SR}



	ff
	FLAGS FAQs SR-II_Part17
	FLAGS FAQs SR-II_Part18

